ENROLLMENT(S)
i

)



COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
D.C. LAW 11-110

"Technical Amendments Act of 1996".

Pursuant to Section 412 of the District of Columbia Self-Government and Governmental
Reorganization Act, P.L. 93-198 "the Act", the Council of the District of Columbia
adopted Bill No. 11-485 on first and second readings, December 5, 1995 and January 4,
1996 respectively. Following the signature of the Mayor on January 26, 1996, pursuant
to Section 404(e) of "the Act", and was assigned Act No. 11-199 and published in the
February 9, 1996, edition of the D.C. Register (Vol. 43 page 530) and transmitted to
Congress on February 22, 1996 for a 30-day review, in accordance with Section 602(c)(1)
of the Act.

The Council of the District of Columbia hereby gives notice that the 30-day
Congressional Review Periodrhas expired, and therefore, cites this enactment as D.C.

Law 11-110, effective April 18, 1996.

fg f

YAVID A. CLARKE
Chairman of the Council

Dates Counted During the 30-day Congressional Review Period:
Feb. 22,23,26,27,28,29

March  1,4,5,6,7,8,11,12,13,14,15,18,19,20,21,22,25,26,
27,28,29

April  15,16,17



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Codification
District of
AN ACT Columbia
Code
D.C. ACT 11-199 1996 Supp.

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

JANUARY 26, 1996

To amend the Comprehensive Plan Amendments Act of 1994 to include an inadvertently
omitted amendment regarding Ward 7 transportation; to amend the District of Columbia
Government Comprehensive Merit Personnel Act of 1978 to repeal the provision
prohibiting investment of retirement funds in the Republic of South Africa and Namibia;
to amend the District of Columbia Retirement Reform Act to correct a punctuation error;
to amend the District of Columbia Election Code of 1955 to correct grammatical errors;
to amend the District of Columbia Public Accounting Act of 1977 to correct grammatical
and typographical errors; to amend the District of Columbia Health Occupations
Revision Act of 1985 to correct the effective date of amendments relating to practitioners
of respiratory care and qualified massage therapy and to correct grammatical errors; to
amend the Omnibus Sports Consolidation Act of 1994 to correct a typographical error; to
amend the District of Columbia Public Assistance Act of 1982 to correct typographical
errors; to amend the Emergency Assistance Program Act of 1988 to correct punctuation
and grammatical errors; to amend the District of Columbia Housing Authority Act of
1994 to correct grammatical errors; to amend the District of Columbia Underground
Storage Tank Management Act of 1990 to delete an extraneous designation; to amend the
Prevention of Child Abuse and Neglect Act of 1977 to correct grammatical errors; to
amend the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs Civil Infractions Act of 1985
to correct grammatical errors; to amend the Illegal Dumping Enforcement Act of 1994 to
correct grammatical errors; to amend the District of Columbia Solid Waste Management
and Multi-Material Recycling Act of 1988 to correct grammatical errors; to amend the
District of Columbia Low-Level Radioactive Waste Generator Regulatory Policy Act of
1990 to delete an extraneous designation; to amend the Street and Alley Closing and
Acquisition Procedures Act of 1982 to correct an erroneous citation; to amend An Act To
vest in the Commissioners of the District of Columbia control of street parking in said
District to correct a grammatical error; to amend the Recreation Act of 1994 to correct



i
ENROLLED ORIGINAL

erroneous section references and a grammatical error; to amend An Act Authorizing the sale of
certain real estate in the District of Columbia no longer required for public purposes to delete
extraneous language; to amend the Retail Service Station Act of 1976 to correct grammatical
errors; to amend section 14-102(b) of the District of Columbia Code to insert a paragraph
designation; to amend Title 16 of the District of Columbia Code to correct grammatical errors;
to amend Title 20 of the District of Columbia Code to delete extraneous subsection headings and
to correct a punctuation error; to amend section 28:2A-525 of the District of Columbia Code to
correct a typographical error; to amend section 28:3-308(b) of the District of Columbia Code to
correct an erroneous reference designation; to amend section 28:3-404(c) of the District of
Columbia Code to correct an erroneous reference designation; to amend section 28-3702(d)(3) of
the District of Columbia Code to correct a typographical error; to amend the District of
Columbia Business Corporation Act to make clarifying conforming amendments; to amend the
District of Columbia Nonprofit Corporation Act to correct a grammatical error; to amend the
Limited Liability Company Act of 1994 to correct a typographical error; to amend the District of
Columbia Child Support Enforcement Amendment Act of 1985 to correct a grammatical error;
to amend the Health Services Planning Program Act of 1992 to correct a typographical error; to
amend the District of Columbia Uniform Controlled Substances Act of 1981 to correct a
grammatical error and an erroneous reference designation; to amend the Life Insurance Act of
1901 to correct a grammatical error; to amend An Act To regulate the business of life insurance
in the District of Columbia to correct a grammatical error; to amend the Life Insurance Act to
correct a spelling error; to amend the Fire and Casualty Act to add a subsection designation; to
amend the Life Insurance Act to correct a punctuation error; to amend the Insurers
Rehabilitation and Liquidation Act of 1993 to correct a grammatical error; to amend the
Managing General Agents Act of 1993 to correct paragraph and subparagraph designations; to
amend the Holding Company System Act of 1993 to correct organizational designations; to
amend the Displaced Workers Protection Act of 1994 to add modifying language; to amend the
Parental Leave Act of 1994 to correct grammatical errors; to amend the Public Parking Authority
Establishment Act of 1994 to add clarifying language; to amend the Alternative Fuels
Technology Act of 1990 to correct a typographical error; to amend An Act To establish a code of
law for the District of Columbia to correct a section reference; to amend the Condominium Act
of 1976 to make a stylistic correction; to amend the Housing Finance Agency Act of 1978 to add
clarifying language; to amend the District of Columbia Real Estate Appraiser Act of 1990 to
make a stylistic correction; to amend the District of Columbia Unemployment Compensation Act
to correct a punctuation error; to amend the Reprogramming Policy Act of 1980 to add clarifying
language; to amend the District of Columbia Real Property Tax Revision Act of 1974 to make a
stylistic correction; to amend An Act In relation to taxes and tax sales in the District of Columbia
to add clarifying language; to amend An Act Making appropriations to provide for the expenses
of the government of the District of Columbia for the fiscal year ending June thirtieth, nineteen
hundred and three, and for other purposes to correct a grammatical error; to amend the Clean Air
Compliance Fee Act of 1994 to correct a typographical error; to amend the Qualified Therapists

2



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Amendment Act of 1994 to delete a subsection designation; to amend the Hotel Occupancy and
Surtax on Corporations and Unincorporated Business Tax of Act of 1977 to correct a
typographical error; to amend the Omnibus Budget Support Act of 1993 to correct a reference
designation; to amend the Urban Renewal Plan for the Southwest Urban Renewal Area, Project
"C", First Modification Approval Resolution of 1994 to delete extraneous language; to amend
the Omnibus Budget Support Act of 1994 to add clarifying language and to make corrections in
Service Facility Regulation Administration user fees; to amend the South Africa Sanctions
Repeal Act of 1994 to correct a cross reference; to amend the District of Columbia Solid Waste
Management and Multi-Material Recycling Act of 1988 Amendment Act of 1994 to add
clarifying language; to amend the Public Assistance Self-Sufficiency Program Amendment Act
of 1995 to correct a code reference cite; to amend the Anti-Sexual Abuse Act of 1994 to correct
a code reference cite; to amend the Paternity Establishment Act of 1994 to correct a cross
reference; to amend the Probate Reform Act of 1994 to correct a grammatical error; to amend the
Real Property Statutory and Filing Deadlines Conformity Amendment Act of 1994 to correct a
paragraph designation; to amend the Health Occupations Revision Act of 1985 to correct a
section designation; to amend the Youth Facilities Drug Free Zone Amendment Act of 1994 to
correct the period of Congressional review; and to amend the Omnibus Budget Support Act of
1995 and the Chiropractic Licensing Amendment Act of 1994 to correct section designations.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the "Technical Amendments Act of 1996".

Sec. 2. The Comprehensive Plan Amendments Act of 1994, effective October 6, 1994
(D.C. Law 10-193; 41 DCR 5536), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 2(a)(12) (10 DCMR 1200.100 et seq.) is amended by striking section
1200.709(f)(9) and (g) and inserting the following new section 1200.710 in its place:

“SEC. 1200.710 WARD 7 TRANSPORTATION

“(a) The overall transportation objective for Ward 7 is to provide a transportation system
that serves ward residents and others who travel to and from the ward for their broad range of
travel needs and desires. This includes travel to jobs, shopping areas, recreation, and social
activities.

"(b) Transportation systems, historically, have been a major factor in determining city
development and land use patterns. Efficient transportation planning can minimize the need for
trips, especially automobile trips by persons going to and from work, that negatively affect the
local environment. A major consideration in selecting a location for a particular activity is its
accessibility to transportation, which is a major land use in its own right.

"(c) The ward transportation network generally provides for the efficient movement of
vehicles, goods, and services. Traffic on major streets is usually heavy, particularly during
morning and evening peak rush hours. Pennsylvania Avenue, Benning and Naylor Roads, and
East Capitol Street are the major east-west arterials, Kenilworth, Minnesota, and Alabama



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Avenues are the primary north-south arterials, all encompassing high traffic volumes.

"(d) Private automobiles, buses, and Metrorail are the primary means of transportation
within this ward. Neighborhood bus service is usually found on major arterials as opposed to
secondary streets.

“(e) There are three Metrorail stations within the ward, Deanwood, Minnesota Avenue,
and the Benning Road stations, that accommodate ward residents. Although it is located in
Maryland, the Capitol Heights station is adjacent to the District line and is convenient for many
Ward 7 residents. These stations also serve as major transfer points to buses.

“(f) Bicycling, a leisure and recreational activity for some, is also becoming an important
mode of transit. The D.C. Bicycle Advisory Council (BAC) and the Department of Public
Works (DPW) have made progress in updating a Transportation Bicycle Plan. The effort
promotes bicycling as another link in the overall transportation system. The bikeway network in
Ward 7 includes off street trails along a segment of Anacostia Park between East Capitol Street
and Benning Road, a segment along the Watts Branch Creek Park and through Fort Circle Parks
as well as three on street routes along East Capitol Street, Massachusetts Avenue, and
Pennsylvania Avenue. The on street bikeways end at the Anacostia River bridges.

“(g) Additional transportation services, such as the Call-N-Ride Taxi Service for the
elderly, Washington Elderly and Handicapped Transportation Service, and publicly supported
taxi service are commuter services available to the ward's elderly and disabled residents.".

(b) Section 3(b)(1) is amended in the lead-in language by striking the phrase "Section
4(b)(5) (D.C. Code § 1-247(b)(5))" and inserting the phrase "Section 4(c)(5) (D.C. Code § 1-
247(c)(5))" in its place.

Sec. 3. Section 2611(c) of the District of Columbia Government Comprehensive Merit
Personnel Act of 1978, effective October 1, 1987 (D.C. Law 7-27; D.C. Code § 1-627.11(c)), is
repealed.

Sec. 4. Section 121(b)(1)(A)(vii) of the District of Columbia Retirement Reform Act,
approved November 17, 1979 (93 Stat. 870; D.C. Code § 1-711(b)(1)(A)(vii)), is amended by
striking the period at the end of the sub-subparagraph and inserting a semicolon in its place.

Sec. 5. The District of Columbia Election Code of 1955, approved August 12, 1955 (69
Stat. 699; D.C. Code § 1-1301 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(a) Section 7 (D.C. Code § 1-1311) is amended as follows:
(1) Subsection (d)(3)(D) is amended by striking the phrase "Ethics." The name"
and inserting the phrase "Ethics."; the name" in its place.
(2) Subsection (1)(2) is amended by adding the phrase "his or her” after the word
"changes".
(b) Section 17 (D.C. Code § 1-1321) is amended by striking the phrase "shall be have
printed” and inserting the phrase "shall have printed" in its place.

4

Section
1-247

Section
1-627.11

Section
1-711

Section
1-1311

Section
1-1321



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 6. The District of Columbia Public Accounting Act of 1977, effective March 16,
1978 (D.C. Law 2-59; D.C. Code § 2-101 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 17(a) (D.C. Code § 2-116(a)) is amended by striking the word "it" the first
time it appears and inserting the phrase "the firm" in its place.

(b) Section 23 (D.C. Code § 2-122) is amended by striking the word "number" and
inserting the word "member” in its place.

Sec. 7. The District of Columbia Health Occupations Revision Act of 1985, effective
March 25, 1986 (D.C. Law 6-99; D.C. Code § 2-3301.1 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 102(3)(A) (D.C. Code § 2-3301.2(3)(A)) is amended by striking the phrase
"The practice of chiropractic" and inserting the phrase "'Practice of Chiropractic" in its place.

(b) Section 401(b)(2) (D.C. Code § 2-3304.1(b)(2)) is amended by striking the word
"and" the first time it appears and inserting the phrase "; and" after the word "Counseling".

(¢) Section 720 (D.C. Code § 2-3307.21) is amended by striking the phrase "effective
date of this act," and inserting the phrase "effective date of the Respiratory Care Practice
Amendment Act of 1994," in its place.

(d) Section 721 (D.C. Code § 2-3307.22) is amended by striking the phrase "effective
date of this act," and inserting the phrase "effective date of the Respiratory Care Practice
Amendment Act of 1994," in its place.

(e) Section 730 (D.C. Code § 2-3307.31) is amended by striking the phrase "effective
date of this act," and inserting the phrase "effective date of the Qualified Massage Therapists
Amendment Act of 1994," in its place.

(f) Section 731 (D.C. Code § 2-3307.32) is amended by striking the phrase "effective
date of this act," and inserting the phrase "effective date of the Qualified Massage Therapists
Amendment Act of 1994," in its place.

(g) Section 1003(b) (D.C. Code § 2-3310.3(b)) is amended by inserting quotation marks

after the word "anesthetist”, striking the word "or" before the phrase "'N.P.", and inserting a
comma after the phrase "N.P.".

Sec. 8. Section 14 of the Omnibus Sports Consolidation Act of 1994, effective August
23,1994 (D.C. Law 10-152; D.C. Code § 2-4013), is amended as follows:

(a) Subsection (b)(2) is amended by striking the phrase "rank of priority" and inserting
the phrase "rank or priority" in its place.

(b) Subsection (g) is amended by striking the word "affect" and inserting the word
"effect” in its place.

Sec. 9. The District of Columbia Public Assistance Act of 1982, effective April 6, 1982
(D.C. Law 4-101; D.C. Code § 3-201.1 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 511(a)(5)(A-1) (D.C. Code § 3-205.11(a)(5)(A-1)) is amended by striking the

phrase "$100 plus 40% disregard" and inserting the phrase "$100 plus 50% disregard" in its

5

Section
2-116

Section
2-122

Section
2-3301.2

Section
2-3304.1

Section

2-3307.21

Section

2-3307.22

Section

2-3307.31

Section
2-3307.32

Section
2-3310.3

Section
2-4013

Section
3.205.11



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

place.
(b) Section 552(c-1)(1)(B) (D.C. Code § 3-205.52(c-1)(1)(B)) is amended by striking the S:;‘;:’S‘z
word "recipients” and inserting the word "recipient” in its place.

Sec. 10. Section 5(a) of the Emergency Assistance Program Act of 1988, eftective Section
March 16, 1989 (D.C. Law 7-221; D.C. Code § 3-1004(a)), is amended as follows: 3-1004

(a) By adding a comma after the word "subsection"; and

(b) By striking the phrase "time-frame" and inserting the phrase "time frame" in its place.

Sec. 11. The District of Columbia Housing Authority Act of 1994, effective March 21,
1994 (D.C. Law 10-243; D.C. Code § 5-121 et seq.), is amended as follows:

Section

(a) Section 6(c) (D.C. Code § 5-124(c)) is amended by striking the word "section” 5-124
wherever it appears and inserting the word "subsection" in its place. .
(b) Section 14 (D.C. Code § 5-132) is amended by striking the phrase "the District ?;;‘2"“

taxation" and inserting the phrase "District taxation" in its place.

Sec. 12. Section 10(h) of the District of Columbia Underground Storage Tank Section
Management Act of 1990, effective March 8, 1991 (D.C. Law 8-242; D.C. Code § 6-995.9(h)), is ****?
amended by striking the phrase "("Court")".

Sec. 13. The Prevention of Child Abuse and Neglect Act of 1977, effective September
23,1977 (D.C. Law 2-22; D.C. Code § 6-2101 et seq.), is amended as follows: Section
(a) Section 106a(2) (D.C. Code § 6-2104.1(2)) is amended by adding the word "and" to 621041
the end of the paragraph. .
(b) Section 203(a) (D.C. Code § 6-2113(a)) is amended as follows: e
(1) Paragraph (5) is amended by striking the word "and" at the end.
(2) Paragraph (6) is amended by striking the period and inserting the phrase ";
and" in its place.

Sec. 14. Section 103(b) of the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs Civil Section
Infractions Act of 1985, effective October 5, 1985 (D.C. Law 6-42; D.C. Code § 6-2703(b)),is  ~2*
amended as follows:

(a) Paragraph (5) is amended by striking the word "and" at the end.

(b) Paragraph (6) is amended by striking the period and inserting the phrase "; and” in its
place.

Sec. 15. The Illegal Dumping Enforcement Act of 1994, effective May 20, 1994 (D.C.
Law 10-117; D.C. Code § 6-2911 et seq.), is amended as follows: Section
(a) Section 2(6) (D.C. Code § 6-2911(6)) is amended by adding a comma after the word 62911
“shavings".



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

(b) Section 3(e) (D.C. Code § 6-2912(e)) is amended by striking the phrase "to refund"
and inserting the word "refund" in its place.

Sec. 16. Section 9(b) of the District of Columbia Solid Waste Management and Multi-
Material Recycling Act of 1988, effective March 16, 1989 (D.C. Law 7-226; D.C. Code § 6-
3408(b)), is amended as follows:

(a) Paragraph (11) is amended by striking the word "and" at the end.

(b) Paragraph (12) is amended by striking the period and adding the phrase "; and” in its
place.

Sec. 17. Section 3(d) of the District of Columbia Low-Level Radioactive Waste
Generator Regulatory Policy Act of 1990, effective December 27, 1990 (D.C. Law 8-226; D.C.
Code § 6-3702(d)), is amended by striking the phrase "("Council")".

Sec. 18. Section 101(4) of the Street and Alley Closing and Acquisition Procedures Act
of 1982, effective March 10, 1982 (D.C. Law 4-201; D.C. Code § 7-411(4)), is amended by
striking the phrase "7-108" and inserting the phrase "7-107" in its place.

Sec. 19. Section 6a(b)(4) of An Act To vest in the Commissioners of the District of
Columbia control of street parking in said District, effective March 16,1995 (D.C. Law 10-226;
D.C. Code § 8-137.1), is amended by striking the phrase "the subsection” and inserting the
phrase "this subsection" in its place.

Sec. 20. The Recreation Act of 1994, effective March 23, 1995 (D.C. Law 10-246; D.C.
Code § 8-301 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 4(d) (D.C. Code § 8-303(d)) is amended by striking the phrase "section 8" and
inserting the phrase "section 7" in its place.

(b) Section 5(a) (D.C. Code § 8-304(a)) is amended by striking the word "another" and
inserting the word "other" in its place.

(c) Section 7(d) (D.C. Code § 8-306(d)) is amended by striking the phrase "section 3" and
inserting the phrase "section 4" in its place.

Sec. 21. Section 1 of An Act Authorizing the sale of certain real estate in the District of
Columbia no longer required for public purposes, approved August 5, 1939 (53 Stat. 1211; D.C.
Code § 9-401), is amended as follow:

(a) Subsection (g) is amended by striking the phrase "of Columbia ("District")".

(b) Subsection (h) is amended by striking the phrase "District of Columbia Board of
Education ("Board")" and inserting the word "Board" in its place.

(c) Subsection (i) is amended by striking the phrase "of Education”, and by striking the
phrase "the Franklin School" and inserting the word "Franklin" in its place.

7

Section
6-2912

Section
6-3408

Section
6-3702

Section
7-411

Section
8-137.1

Section
8-303

Section
8-304

Section

8-306

Section
9-401



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

(d) Subsection (j) is amended by striking the phrase "of Columbia”.
(e) Subsection (k) is amended by striking the phrase "of Education”.

Sec. 22. Section 5-301 of the Retail Service Station Act of 1976, effective April 19,
1977 (D.C. Law 1-123; D.C. Code § 10-231), is amended as follows:

(a) Subsection (c) is amended by striking the quotation marks wherever they appear.

(b) Subsection (d)(1)(C)(ii) is amended by adding the word "and" to the end of the sub-
subparagraph.

(¢) Subsection (f) is amended by striking the quotation marks wherever they appear.

Sec. 23. Section 14-102(b) of the District of Columbia Code is amended by striking the
phrase "motive or an identification" and inserting the phrase "motive, or (3) an identification" in
its place.

Sec. 24. Title 16 of the District of Columbia Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 16-909.1(b) is amended by striking the word "an" and inserting the word "a”
in its place.
(b) Section 16-911(a)(5) is amended as follows:
(1) Subparagraph (D) is amended by striking the word "and" at the end of the
paragraph.
(2) Subparagraph (E) is amended by adding the word "and" at the end of the
paragraph.

Sec. 25. Title 20 of the District of Columbia Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 20-101(d)(1)(E) is amended by adding a comma after the word "death".
(b) Section 20-403 is amended as follows:
(1) Subsection (a) is amended by striking the phrase "Change during
administration to unsupervised administration.”.
(2) Subsection (c) is amended by striking the phrase "Prospective change.".

Sec. 26. Section 28:2A-525 of the District of Columbia Code is amended by striking the
phrase "the lessee has the right" in the first sentence and inserting the phrase "the lessor has the
right" in its place.

Sec. 27. Article 3 of subtitle I of title 28 of the District of Columbia Code is amended as
follows:

(a) Section 28:3-308(b) is amended by striking the phrase "of this subsection" and
inserting the phrase "of this section" in its place.

(b) Section 28:3-404(c) is amended by striking the phrase "of this subsection" and
inserting the phrase "of this section" in its place.

Section
10-231

Section
14-102

Section
16-909.1

Section
16-911

Section
20-101
Section
20-403

Section
28:2A-525

Section
28:3-308
Section
28:3-404



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 28. Section 28-3702(d)(3) of the District of Columbia Code is amended by striking
the word "charged" and inserting the word "changed" in its place.

Sec. 29. The District of Columbia Business Corporation Act, approved June 8, 1954 (68
Stat. 179; D.C. Code § 29-301 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 123(a) (D.C. Code § 29-399.24(a)) is amended by striking the word "annual"
and inserting the phrase "5-year" in its place.

(b) Section 125 (D.C. Code § 29-399.26) is amended by striking the word "annual" and
inserting the phrase "5-year" in its place.

(c) Section 127 (D.C. Code § 29-399.28) is amended by striking the word "annual" and
inserting the phrase "5-year" in its place.

Sec. 30. Section 85 of the District of Columbia Nonprofit Corporation Act, approved
August 6, 1962 (76 Stat. 265; D.C. Code § 29-586), is amended by striking the phrase "file an
report” and inserting the phrase "file a report” in its place.

Sec. 31. Section 48(3) of the Limited Liability Company Act of 1994, effective July 23,
1994 (D.C. Law 10-138; D.C. Code § 29-1347(3)), is amended by striking the phrase "would up"
and inserting the phrase "wound up" in its place.

Sec. 32. Section 6(1) of the District of Columbia Child Support Enforcement
Amendment Act of 1985, effective February 24, 1987 (D.C. Law 6-166; D.C. Code § 30-
505(1)), is amended by striking the period at the end of the paragraph and inserting the phrase ";
and" in its place.

Sec. 33. Section 4(b)(3) of the Health Services Planning Program Act of 1992, effective
March 16, 1993, (D.C. Law 9-197; D.C. Code § 32-323(b)(3)), is amended by striking "OHSP"
and inserting "OHSD" in its place.

Sec. 34. The District of Columbia Uniform Controlled Substances Act of 1981, effective
August 5, 1981 (D.C. Law 4-29; D.C. Code § 33-501 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 102(30) (D.C. Code § 33-501(30)) is amended by striking the word "contain"
and inserting the word "contains" in its place.

(b) Section 401(g) (D.C. Code § 33-541(g)) is amended by striking the word "subsection"
and inserting the word "section" in its place.

Sec. 35. Section 646(c) of the Life Insurance Act of 1901, effective March 21, 1995
(D.C. Law 10-233; D.C. Code § 35-102(c)), is amended in the second sentence by striking the
comma after the word "Superintendent".

Section
28-3702

Section
29-399.24

Section
29-399.26
Section
29-399.28

Section
29-586

Section
29-1347

Section
30-505

Section
32-323

Section
33-501

Section
33-541

Section
35-102



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 36. Section 12.2(a)(7) of the Life Insurance Act, approved June 19, 1934 (48 Stat.
1166; D.C. Code § 35-517(b)(1)(G)), is amended by striking the word "and" at the end of the
paragraph.

Sec. 37. Section 45(c) of the Life Insurance Act, effective March 14, 1985 (D.C. Law 5-
160; D.C. Code § 35-643(c)), is amended by striking the word "principle" and inserting the word
“principal” in its place.

Sec. 38. Section 22(f) of the Fire and Casualty Act, approved October 9, 1940 (54 Stat.
1074; D.C. Code § 35-1526(f)), is amended in the first sentence by striking the phrase "proof of
compliance" and inserting the phrase "(f) proof of compliance" in its place.

Sec. 39. Section 6(a) of the Life Insurance Act, approved May 20, 1948 (62 Stat. 245;
D.C. Code § 35-1706(a)), is amended by striking the semicolon after the phrase "(31 Stat. 1209;
D.C. Code § 35-102)".

Sec. 40. Section 18(b) of the Insurers Rehabilitation and Liquidation Act of 1993,
effective October 15,1993 (D.C. Law 10-35; D.C. Code § 35-2817(b)), is amended by striking
the phrase "as order of" and inserting the phrase "An order of" in its place.

Sec. 41. Section 2(4) of the Managing General Agents Act of 1993, effective October 21,
1993 (D.C. Law 10-41; D.C. Code § 35-3001(4)), is amended as follows:

(a) The lead-in language is designated as subparagraph (A).

(b) Subparagraph (A) is redesignated as sub-subparagraph (i).

(c) Subparagraph (B) is redesignated as sub-subparagraph (ii).

(d) Subparagraph (C) is redesignated as sub-subparagraph (iii).

(e) Subparagraph (D) is redesignated as subparagraph (B).

Sec. 42. Section 5(b)(2)(E) of the Holding Company System Act of 1993, effective
October 21, 1993 (D.C. Law 10-44; D.C. Code § 35-3704(b)(2)(E)), is amended as follows:

(a) The lead-in language is designated as sub-subparagraph (i).

(b) Sub-subparagraph (i) is redesignated as sub-sub-subparagraph (I).

(c) Sub-subparagraph (ii) is redesignated as sub-sub-subparagraph (II).

(d) Sub-subparagraph (iii) is redesignated as sub-sub-subparagraph (III).

(e) Sub-subparagraph (iv) is redesignated as sub-subparagraph (ii).

Sec. 43. Section 3(g) of the Displaced Workers Protection Act of 1994, effective April
26, 1994 (D.C. Law 10-105; D.C. Code § 36-1502(g)), is amended by adding the phrase "at
least" after the word "retain".

Sec. 44. The Parental Leave Act of 1994, effective June 23, 1994 (D.C. Law 10-146;

10

Section
35-517

Section
35-643

Section
35-1526

Section
35-1706

Section
35-2817

Section
35-3001

Section
35-3704

Section
36-1502



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

D.C. Code § 36-1601 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(a) Section 2(3) ( D.C. Code § 36-1601(3)) is amended as follows:
(1) By striking the phrase "concert or play, or rehearsal” and inserting the phrase
"concert, play, or rehearsal” in its place; and
(2) By striking the comma after the word "team".
(b) Section 5 (D.C. Code § 36-1604) is amended as follows:
(1) Subsection (b)(6) is amended as follows:
(A) Subparagraph (A) is amended by striking the word "and" at the end.
(B) Subparagraph (B) is amended by adding the word "and" at the end.
(2) Subsection (d)(2) is amended by adding a comma after the word "institute.”

Sec. 45. The Public Parking Authority Establishment Act of 1994, effective August 23,
1994 (D.C. Law 10-153; D.C. Code § 40-841 et seq.)), is amended as follows:
(a) Section 12(b) (D.C. Code § 40-851(b)) is amended as follows:
(1) By striking the word "and" after the phrase "Class 3" and inserting a comma
in its place; and
(2) By adding the phrase “, and Class 5" after the phrase "Class 4".
(b) Section 13(n) (D.C. Code § 40-852(n)) is amended by striking the word "director”
and inserting the phrase "Executive Director” in its place.

Sec. 46. Section 14(c) of the Alternative Fuels Technology Act of 1990, effective March
8, 1991 (D.C. Law 8-243; D.C. Code § 40-2012(c)), is amended by striking the word
"enacement" and inserting the word "enactment” in its place.

Sec. 47. Section 519 of An Act To establish a code of law for the District of Columbia,
approved March 3, 1901 (31 Stat. 532; D.C. Code § 45-804), is amended by striking the phrase
", as mentioned in sections 515 and 516,".

Sec. 48. The Condominium Act of 1976, effective March 29, 1977 (D.C. Law 1-89; D.C.
Code § 45-1801 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(a) Section 309(d) (D.C. Code § 45-1849(d)) is amended by striking the phrase "1st" and
inserting the word "first" in its place.

(b) Section 310(f) (D.C. Code § 45-1850(f)) is amended by striking the phrase "1st" and
inserting the word "first" in its place.

Sec. 49. Section 304(a) of the Housing Finance Agency Act of 1978, effective March 3,
1979 (D.C. Law 2-135; D.C. Code § 45-2124(a)), is amended by adding the phrase "of this
section" after the phrase "subsection (a-1)".

Sec. 50. Sections 3(e), 4(a), and 32(f) of the District of Columbia Real Estate Appraiser

11

Section
36-1601

Section
36-1604

Section
40-851

Section
40-852

Section
40-2012

Section
45-804

Section
45-1849

Section
45-1850

Section
45-2124



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Act of 1990, effective March 7, 1991 (D.C. Law 8-219; D.C. Code §§ 45-3202(¢), 45-3203(a), §§°;‘2°(;‘;
and 45-3231(f)), are amended by striking the phrase "1st" wherever it appears and inserting the  45-3203,

word "first" in its place. 45-3231

Sec. 51. Section 9(d)(2) of the District of Columbia Unemployment Compensation Act, . .
approved August 28, 1935 (49 Stat. 946; D.C. Code § 46-110(4)(B)), is amended by striking the  46-110
period at the end of the paragraph and inserting a semicolon in its place.

Sec. 52. Section 4 of the Reprogramming Policy Act of 1980, effective September 16, 3:55or
1980 (D.C. Law 3-100; D.C. Code § 47-363), is amended by adding a new subsection (a-1) to
read as follows:

"(a-1)(A) The Mayor shall also submit reprogramming requests to the District of
Columbia Financial Responsibility and Management Assistance Authority as required by section
203(c)(1) of the District of Columbia Financial Responsibility and Management Assistance Act
of 1995, approved April 17, 1995 (109 Stat. 119; D.C. Code § 47-392.3(c)(1)).

"(B) The Council may only approve a reprogramming submitted by the Mayor to
the Council pursuant to the provisions of this section and section 203(c)(2) of the District of
Columbia Financial Responsibility and Management Assistance Act of 1995, approved April 17,
1995 (109 Stat. 119; D.C. Code § 47-392.3(c)(2)).".

Sec. 53. Section 426a(d)(4) of the District of Columbia Real Property Tax Revision Act ~ Section
of 1974, effective March 17, 1993 (D.C. Law 9-241; D.C. Code § 47-825.1(d)(4)), is amended ~ *7251
by striking the numeral "14" and inserting the phrase "14th" in its place.

Sec. 54. Section 2a of An Act In relation to taxes and tax sales in the District of Section
Columbia, effective April 30, 1994 (D.C. Law 1-115; D.C. Code § 47-1303.1), is amended by 47-1303.1
striking the phrase "For the purpose of this act" and inserting the phrase "For the purposes of
sections 2b and 2¢" in its place.

Sec. 55. Section 6(5)(A) of An Act Making appropriations to provide for the expenses of
the government of the District of Columbia for the fiscal year ending June thirtieth, nineteen ——
hundred and three, and for other purposes, approved July 1, 1902 (32 Stat. 617; D.C. Code § 47-
2501(a)), is amended by striking the word "service”" and inserting the word "services" in its
place.

Sec. 56. The Clean Air Compliance Fee Act of 1994, effective March 21, 1995 (D.C.

Law 10-242; D.C. Code § 47-2731 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(@) Section 5(b)(1)(B) (D.C. Code § 47-2734(b)(1)(B)) is amended by striking the phrase Section
"parkings spaces;" and inserting the phrase "parking spaces;" in its place. 472734

(b) Section 10(d) (D.C. Code § 47-2739(d)) is amended by inserting the phrase "section  geegion
5 of” after the phrase "pursuant to". 47-2739

12



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 57. Section 3 of the Qualified Therapists Amendment Act of 1994, effective March ot Scction
14, 1995 (D.C. Law 10-205; D.C. Code § 47-2811, note), is amended by striking the subsection
designation "(a)".

Sec. 58. Section 106 of the Hotel Occupancy and Surtax on Corporations and Section
Unincorporated Business Tax Act of 1977, effective March 16, 1978 (D.C. Law 2-58; D.C. Code 47-32%
§ 47-3206), is amended by striking the word "dispersed” wherever it appears and inserting the
word "disbursed” in its place.

Sec. 59. Section 111(c)(2)(A) of the Omnibus Budget Support Act of 1993, effective
September 30, 1993 (D.C. Law 10-25; 40 DCR 5489), is amended to read as follows: Section
"(A) Paragraph (1)(A) (D.C. Code § 47-2001(n)(2)(A)(i)) is amended to  47-2001
read as follows:
"(A) Sales of transportation and communication services other than sales
of data processing services, information services, local telephone service, or any service
enumerated in paragraph (16) of subsection (a) of this section.".

Sec. 60. Section 3(c) of the Urban Renewal Plan for the Southwest Urban Renewal Area,
Project "C", First Modification Approval Resolution of 1994, effective December 6, 1994 (Res.
10-472; 41 DCR 8155), is amended by striking the phrase "north of Virginia Avenue, south of
Virginia Avenue," and inserting the phrase "south of Virginia Avenue," in its place.

Sec. 61. The Omnibus Budget Support Act of 1994, effective June 14, 1994 (D.C. Law
10-128; 41 DCR 2096), is amended as follows:
(@) Section 403(a)(1)(D) is amended by striking the phrase "not to exceed" and inserting
the phrase "shall not exceed" wherever it appears.
(b) Section 501(a) is amended as follows: DCMR
(1) Paragraph (1) is amended by striking the word "Interstate” and inserting the
word "In-state” in its place.
(2) Paragraph (6) is amended by striking the word "reinspection” and inserting
the word "preinspection” in its place.
(3) Paragraph (7) is amended by striking the word "reinspection” and inserting
the word "licensure” in its place.
(4) Paragraph (9) is amended by striking the sum "$500.00" and inserting the
sum "$1,500.00" in its place.
(5) Paragraph (12) is amended by striking the phrase "fee and annual
reinspection”.
(6) Paragraph (13) is amended by striking the phrase "fee and annual
reinspection”.
(7) Paragraph (14) is amended by striking the phrase "fee and annual reinspection

Section
35-1545

13



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

fees".

Sec. 62. Section 4(a) of the South Africa Sanctions Repeal Act of 1994, effective April i;f;il";ﬁ
28,1994 (D.C. Law 10-134; 41 DCR 2597), is amended by striking the phrase "and in
accordance with section 412" and inserting the phrase "section 412 and" in its place.

Sec. 63. Section 3(h) of the District of Columbia Solid Waste Management and Multi-
Material Recycling Act of 1988 Amendment Act of 1994, effective September 24, 1994 (D.C.
Law 10-178; 41 DCR 5205), is amended to read as follows:
“(h) Section 16 (D.C. Code § 6-3415) is amended as follows: Section
"(1) Subsection (a) is amended by striking the phrase "Litter and Solid Waste 6-3415
Reduction Commission" and inserting the phrase "Environmental Planning Commission” in its
place.
"(2) Subsection (b) is amended to read as follows:
"(b) On January 15th of each year the Mayor shall submit to the Council the following:
"(1) An annual report on all income received from the recycling surcharge during
the previous fiscal year;
"(2) Aline-item report on all disbursements made from the recycling surcharge
during the previous fiscal year; and
"(3) A proposed plan for the use of all monies in the recycling surcharge for the
current fiscal year.".
"(3) A new subsection (c) is added to read as follows:
"(c) The proposed plan submitted by the Mayor pursuant to subsection (b)(3) of this
section shall be submitted to the Council for approval, in whole or in part, by resolution. The
expenditure of recycling surcharge monies shall be subject to Council approval of the annual
report required to be submitted pursuant to subsection (b)(1) of this section.".

Sec. 64. Section 201(b) of the Public Assistance Self-Sufficiency Program Amendment
Act of 1995, signed by the Mayor on August 19, 1995 (D.C. Act 11-139; 42 DCR 4728), is
amended by striking the phrase "D.C. § 3-205.4" and inserting the phrase "D.C. Code § 3-205.4"
in its place.

Sec. 65. Section 401(e) of the Anti-Sexual Abuse Act of 1994, effective May 23, 1995
(D.C. Law 10-257; 42 DCR 53), is amended by striking the phrase "§ 16-3201" and inserting the
phrase "§ 16-2301" in its place.

Sec. 66. Section 2(j) of the Paternity Establishment Act of 1994, effective March 16,

1995 (D.C. Law 10-233; 41 DCR 8051), is amended by striking the phrase "16-2342.3" and
inserting the phrase "16-2343.3".

14



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 67. Section 3(ff)(1)(A) of the Probate Reform Act of 1994, effective March 21,
1995 (D.C. Law 10-241; 42 DCR 63), is amended by striking the word "representatives" and
inserting the word "representative" in its place.

Sec. 68. Section 3(a)(4) of the Real Property Statutory and Filing Deadlines Conformity
Amendment Act of 1994, effective June 14, 1994 (D.C. Law 10-127; 41 DCR 2050), is amended
by striking the phrase "(4C)" both times it appears and inserting the phrase "(4B)" in its place.

Sec. 69. Section 2(w) of the District of Columbia Health Occupations Revision Act of
1985 Amendment Act of 1994, effective March 23, 1995 (D.C. Law 10-247; 42 DCR 457), is g;";‘(;’;‘
amended by striking the phrase "Section 608 (D.C. Code § 2-3306.8)" and inserting the phrase
"Section 608(a) (D.C. Code § 2-3306.8(a))" in its place.

Sec. 70. Section 3 of the Youth Facilities Drug Free Zone Amendment Act of 1994,
effective March 21, 1995 (D.C. Law 10-229; 42 DCR 10), is amended by striking the phrase
"60-day" and inserting the phrase "30-day" in its place.

Sec. 71. Section 117(a) of the Omnibus Budget Support Act of 1995, effective
September 25, 1995 (D.C. Law 11-52; 42 DCR 3684), is amended to read as follows:

"(a) Section 112 shall apply to taxes on personal property of a telecommunication
company that become due on or after October 1, 1994.".

Sec. 72. Section 2(d) of the Chiropractic Licensing Amendment Act of 1994, effective
March 21, 1995 (D.C. Law 10-231; 42 DCR 15), is amended by striking the phrases "section
214" and "Sec. 214." and inserting the phrases "section 216" and "Sec. 216." respectively, in
their places.

Sec. 73. This act has no fiscal impact inasmuch as its provisions are technical and
clarifying amendments to existing legislation.

Sec. 74. This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of
veto by the Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), approval by the Financial
Responsibility and Management Assistance Authority as provided in section 203(a) of the
District of Columbia Financial Responsibility and Management Assistance Authority Act of
1995, approved April 17, 1995 (109 Stat. 116; D.C. Code § 47-392.3(c)), and a 30-day period of
Congressional review as provided in section 602(c)(1) of the District of Columbia Self-

15



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Government and Governmental Re
D.C. Code § 1-233(cX 1)), ajfd pub

nization Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813;
tion in the District of Columbia Register.

‘Chairman ~ h
Council of the District of Columbia

(4

yor
D1 trict of Columbia

APPROVED: January 26, 1996

16



COUNCIL PERIOD ELEVEN

COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

RECORD OF OFFICIAL COUNCIL YOTE
B11-485

Docket No.

(X ITEM ON CONSENT CALENDAR

(X} ACTION & DATE

ADOPTED FIRST READING, 12-05-95

APPROVED

(X VOICE VOTE

RECORDED VOTE ON REQUEST

ALL PRESENT

ABSENT

{ ] ROLL CALL VOTE - Result

Councilmember Ave | Nay | \V AB Councilimember | Aye | Nay [ NV AB Councilmember Aye | Nay | NV AB
Chmn. Clarke Jarvis Smith, Jr.
Brazil Lightfoot Thomas, Sr.
Chavous Mason Whittington
Cropp Patterson
Evans Ray
X- I!ldicales Vote AB - Absent NV . Present nat Voting

CERTIFICATION RECORD

fwﬁ;

gecre ry to the Coundil

/

xij;w}\ L

[

X

ACTION & DATE

ITEM ON CONSENT CALENDAR ADOPTED FINAL READING,

149

APPROVED

Xl VOICE VOTE

RECORDED VOTE ON REQUEST

ABSENT

ALL PRESENT

[ 1 ROLL CALL VOTE - Result

Councilmember Aye | Nay | NV AB Councilmember | Aye | Nay | NV AB Councilmember Aye | Nay { NV \B
Chmn. Clarke Jarvis Smith, Jr.
Brazil Lightfoot Thomas, Sr.
Chavous Mason Whittington
Cropp Patterson
Evans Ray
Y X-indicates no AB-Absent NV-Present nat voung
g K, * } i CERTIFICATION RECORD { \ N o
S SN [N T \Magac, 5 1456
h ’ i S?g;‘vefﬂurygto the Coundl W hid ate
W i ;
{ | ITEM ON CONSENT CALENDAR
{ 1 ACTION & DATE
[ ] VOICE VOTE
RECORDED VOTE ON REQUEST
ABSENT
[ ] ROLL CALL VOTE - Resuilt e}
Councilmember Aye | Nay } NV AB | Councilmember | Aye | Nay | NV AB Councilmember Aye | Nay | WV AB
Chmn. Clarke Jarvis Smith, Jr.
Brazil Lightfoot Thomas, Sr.
Chavous Mason Whittington
Cropp Patterson
Evans . Ray
X - Indicates Vote AB - Absent NV - Present not Yoting
CERTIFICATION RECORD

Secretary to the Coundl

Date



