ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Codification
District of
Columbia
Official Code
2001 Edition
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA .
2005 Winter
Supp.
West Group
Publisher
To amend An Act To authorize funds for ceremonies in the District of Columbiato authorize
the appropriation of not more than “$100,000 annually for funds for ceremoniesin the
District by the Mayor and the Council, and to authorize the Mayor and the Council to
accept, administer, and use gifts or donations for this purpose.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Ceremonia Funds Amendment Act of 2004”.
Sec. 2. Section 1 of An Act To authorize funds for ceremonies in the District of ng‘s‘; -

Columbia, approved July 11, 1947 (61 Stat. 314, D.C. Official Code § 1-333.09), is amended as
follows:

() Subsection (@) is amended by striking the phrase “$25,000” and inserting the phrase
“$100,000" inits place.

(b) Subsection (b) is amended by striking the phrase “$25,000” and inserting the phrase
“$100,000" inits place.

(c) A new subsection (b-1) is added to read as follows:

“(b-1) The Mayor and Council may accept, administer, and use gifts or donations for
the purpose of aiding, facilitating, and promoting the conduct of ceremonies in the District,
including personal services, for the reception and entertainment, including ceremonial gifts, of
officias of foreign, state, local, or federal governments and other dignitaries and eminent
persons visiting or returning to the District, or for the reception or entertainment of officials of
foreign, state, local, or federal governments when the Mayor is visiting any other jurisdiction in
his or her officia capacity.”.

Sec. 3. Thisact shall be subject to the availability of appropriations.
Sec. 4. Fiscal impact statement.
The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement in the committee report as the fiscal

impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Officia Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Cadification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.



ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 5. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), a 30-day period of Congressional review as
provided in section 602(c)(1) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December
24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813, D.C. Officia Code § 1-206.02(c)(1)), and publication in the District of

Columbia Register.

Chairman
Council of the District of Columbia

Mayor
District of Columbia

Cadification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.



